



BID TABULATION

Description: Weathered Tie Disposal or Recycle for a Period of Four (4) Years

IFB No.: 58179

Bid Solicitation:
Date: 2/27/2020

Specification Nos.: N/A

Bid Open:
Date: 4/3/2020

BIDDER:			T-Cat Enterprise, Inc.		Omaha Track, Inc.		Midwest Companies LLC		American Demolition Corporation		American Recycling & Disposal		Perfect Mulch Products Inc.	
Line	Qty.	Item Description	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total	Unit Price	Total
1	1	Grand Total		\$480,000.00		\$444,000.00		\$564,000.00		\$4,603,500.00		No Bid		No Bid
2				\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00				
3				\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00				
4				\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00				
5				\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00				
6				\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00				
7				\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00				
8				\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00				
9				\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00				
10				\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00				
			Total Price	\$480,000.00	Total Price	\$444,000.00	Total Price	\$564,000.00	Total Price	\$4,603,500.00	Total Price	No Bid	Total Price	No Bid

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only; a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.