BIDDER:

Terry's Ford Terry's Ford Alternate Custom Truck Rush Truck Center Auto Truck Group EJ Equipment
Line [Qty. Item Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 Group | i
No-Bid $229,206.52 $220,000.00 $172,101.00 $216,152.00
2
3 Group I . i
$122,748.00 $124,137.00 $149,853.00 No-Bid $133,449.00 No-Bid
4
5 Group 111 i
$167,404.00 $184,112.00 $171,000.00 $179,590.00 No-Bid
6
7 Group 1V . i
$362,691.00 $417,725.00 No-Bid $354,711.00 No-Bid
8
9
10
Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only, a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.




